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Emerging pollutants can be considered as one of the
key environmental problems requiring a lot of research,
to identify their sources, and their impacts on humans
and ecosystems as well as develop technologies for
their release prevention and removal. As priority groups
of emerging pollutants can be considered
pharmaceuticals and substances used in animal care,
several groups of fluorinated compounds, microplastics
and nanoplastics, nanomaterials and other substances
and materials. However, the first and most important
step is elaboration of reliable analytical methods, to
support further activities aimed at their removal,
considering removal from waste streams as well as
considering removal from contaminated environments. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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