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Energy is one of the key sources of modern life and a
major driver of economic growth. It is therefore
recognised that energy determines the economic and
social development of the world. As a result, there is a
steadily growing interest in the development of
alternative, environmentally friendly energy sources.
Although renewable energy is the fastest growing
energy sector in the world, fossil fuels supply the vast
majority of the world's energy needs. Therefore, it is
extremely important to conduct research on renewable
energy. The search for new energy materials and
technologies guarantees the safe development of the
world. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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