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Antiviral antibody responses are crucial for defending
against viral infections, especially in the context of
emerging diseases. Neutralizing antibodies, which
prevent viral entry into host cells, are a key vaccine goal
due to their long-lasting protection. However, rapid viral
mutations, as seen with influenza and SARS-CoV-2, can
reduce vaccine efficacy. New-generation vaccines have
transformed antiviral immunity by eliciting strong
antibody responses and adapting quickly to viral
variants. Novel adjuvants enhance antibody quality and
durability by modulating immune activation and
promoting broadly neutralizing antibodies. We welcome
studies on antibody generation, neutralizing antibody
roles, vaccine-induced vs. natural immunity, antibody
properties, and B cell responses. Research on new-
generation vaccines and novel adjuvants is highly
encouraged. Additionally, we invite research on novel
adjuvants and their role in enhancing the quality,
durability, and breadth of antiviral antibody responses.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Antibodies is a relatively new journal with a major focus
on quick dissemination of knowledge related to
antibodies, especially how to quickly translate basic
research results to therapeutic applications. Because it
covers all areas related to antibodies unexpected
connections between different areas could be made,
leading to major discoveries and opening new fields of
research and development. This is enhanced by the
large readership of the many antibody-related areas of
research. A specific priority area is human monoclonal
antibodies for therapy of diseases and aging.
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