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  I am delighted to present a Special Issue on the topic
of "Advances in Small Animal Ophthalmic Surgery
(Volume II)". The latest technological developments and
advanced surgical techniques have radically impacted
the clinical practice of veterinary ophthalmic surgeons,
with new diagnostic and treatment procedures making
small animals' ophthalmic surgery safer, faster, and
more precise. This Special Issue aims to provide
examples of new diagnostic and surgical procedures in
the different subfields of small animals' ophthalmology.
Published papers will describe new developments in
these areas. This Special Issue accepts high-quality
articles containing original research results, as well as
review articles and case series of an exceptional merit. 
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Animals is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2011. Animals adheres to rigorous
peerreview and editorial processes and publishes only
high quality manuscripts that address important issues
in the many varied disciplines that involve animals, with
a focus on animal science, animal welfare and animal
ethics. Animals is covered in the Science Citation Index
Expanded (SCIE) in Web of Science, with the latest
Impact Factor: 2.7 (2024, ranks 15/86 (Q1) in
‘Agriculture, Dairy & Animal Science’; 21/170 (Q1) in
‘Veterinary Sciences’), 5-Year Impact Factor: 3.2.
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