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The study of carnivore reproduction has lagged behind
that of larger domestic species. Only after the 1980s did
domestic dog and cat theriogenology achieve
relevance. Although there have been an increasing
number of studies since then, many reproductive
aspects of these species remain to be unveiled. Thus,
the aim of this Special Issue is to publish high-quality
peer-reviewed articles providing an updated overview of
the current state of basic and applied knowledge on
domestic and wild carnivore theriogenology. I am
pleased to invite you to submit your articles to this
Special Issue, “New Insights into the Theriogenology of
Domestic and Wild Carnivores”, which will consider
research areas (among other relevant topics) such as
physiology, pathology, diagnosis methods, therapeutics,
infertility, biotechnology and contraception. Basic or
applied original research, clinical trials, case series and
reviews (of all types) are welcome. I look forward to
receiving your contributions. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Animals is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2011. Animals adheres to rigorous
peerreview and editorial processes and publishes only
high quality manuscripts that address important issues
in the many varied disciplines that involve animals, with
a focus on animal science, animal welfare and animal
ethics. Animals is covered in the Science Citation Index
Expanded (SCIE) in Web of Science, with the latest
Impact Factor: 2.7 (2024, ranks 15/86 (Q1) in
‘Agriculture, Dairy & Animal Science’; 21/170 (Q1) in
‘Veterinary Sciences’), 5-Year Impact Factor: 3.2.
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