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Message from the Guest Editors
Bat species around the world face multiple stressors,
such as climate change, disease and wind energy, that
can have population-level impacts. However, it can be
difficult to quantify the impact of these stressors on bats
because they are a cryptic species. Thus, innovative
approaches are necessary to collect and analyze data to
understand the population status and trends of bats,
and inform conservation decisions. These approaches
include genomics research, the use of advanced
technologies and new systematic sampling frameworks
for field data collection. This Special Issue focuses on
the methodological and analytical approaches used to
study bat populations. These approaches can provide
new insights into the status and trends for colonial or
solitary roosting species. We invite original research
papers and reviews addressing field and laboratory
methods to quantify the bat population status and
trends.   
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Animals is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2011. Animals adheres to rigorous
peerreview and editorial processes and publishes only
high quality manuscripts that address important issues
in the many varied disciplines that involve animals, with
a focus on animal science, animal welfare and animal
ethics. Animals is covered in the Science Citation Index
Expanded (SCIE) in Web of Science, with the latest
Impact Factor: 2.7 (2024, ranks 15/86 (Q1) in
‘Agriculture, Dairy & Animal Science’; 21/170 (Q1) in
‘Veterinary Sciences’), 5-Year Impact Factor: 3.2.
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