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The widespread use of antibiotics to treat infectious
lameness is being challenged, while the direct
involvement of veterinary surgeons to control livestock
disease on-farm is falling. Hence, there is a need in the
current economic and political climate to reassess the
impact of lameness occurring in ruminants and indicate
where future research efforts should be directed. As
demand worldwide on the human food chain increases
and the inevitable consequences of climate change
become more obvious, the pressures on livestock
farmers to provide more beef, lamb, and milk in a more
sustainable way will increase inexorably. We need to
know how to move forward at all levels in the food
production industry, especially with cattle and sheep.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Animals is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2011. Animals adheres to rigorous
peerreview and editorial processes and publishes only
high quality manuscripts that address important issues
in the many varied disciplines that involve animals, with
a focus on animal science, animal welfare and animal
ethics. Animals is covered in the Science Citation Index
Expanded (SCIE) in Web of Science, with the latest
Impact Factor: 2.7 (2024, ranks 15/86 (Q1) in
‘Agriculture, Dairy & Animal Science’; 21/170 (Q1) in
‘Veterinary Sciences’), 5-Year Impact Factor: 3.2.
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