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Forage plants are crucial for livestock nutrition,
enhancing soil health, and supporting biodiversity in
agricultural ecosystems. However, they face significant
challenges, including climate change, soil degradation,
water scarcity, and pests and diseases, which threaten
their productivity and sustainability. Addressing these
problems requires a combination of good agricultural
practices, innovative technologies, and the
development of more resilient crop varieties. Cutting-
edge research on breeding forage plants leverages
traditional breeding efforts to develop varieties with
enhanced traits, tolerance to abiotic and biotic stresses,
and nutrient quality. Additionally, integrating sustainable
management and adopting innovative practices such as
precision agriculture, intercropping, and regenerative
agriculture promotes ecological balance and optimizes
forage production and quality. This Special Issue aims to
consolidate and disseminate innovative research on the
genetics, breeding, cultivation, and management of
forage species. We welcome original research articles,
reviews and case reports covering all related topics. 
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About the Journal
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Agronomy draws together researchers from diverse
areas of agricultural research with a common aim of
enhancing agricultural productivity globally. The journal
provides unlimited free access to all those interested in
advancing agricultural science from both the research
and general community. Papers are released
immediately after acceptance through the internet.
Agronomy is supported by our authors and their
institutes through low article processing charges (APC)
for accepted papers. We hope you will support the
journal by becoming one of our authors.
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