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Sustainability is increasingly becoming a keyword for
viable agricultural activity and food production.
Agricultural and food products are highly influenced by
climate change, the increasing scarcity of natural
resources, and the changes in the availability and use of
land. These call for a redirection of the way primary
activity and food production approach. A sustainable
approach to agriculture, in a global governance context,
can bring the improvement of ecosystems, reduction of
food and natural resource waste, and equitable food
access. Applying the principles of sustainability to
agriculture and food production means taking the three
main dimensions of sustainability: economic, social, and
environmental into consideration simultaneously. This
Special Issue is an occasion to investigate, discuss at a
scientific level, and disseminate in an international
arena, the possible economic strategies and set of
policies to implement sustainable agricultural systems
and food products. We invite you to submit scientific
papers and surveys on these matters, encouraging
multidisciplinary contributions and multidimensional
approaches to sustainability.
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Agriculture (ISSN 2077-0472) is an international, cross-
disciplinary and scholarly journal on the science and
technology of crop and animal production, and
management of the natural resource base for
agricultural production. We invite submissions from
authors according to the aims and scope of the journal
described in more detail on this page. Agriculture is
published in an open access format – articles are
published on the journal’s website immediately after
acceptance, giving the scientific community and the
public unlimited and free access to the content.
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