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Message from the Guest Editors

Innovation is an integral part of the entrepreneurial firm’s
DNA and has been used as part of the definition of the
entrepreneurial firm by scholars. While small and medium
sized enterprises (SMEs) are the backbone of the world
economy (OECD, ACCA), entrepreneurial owner managed
firms seems to make the lion part of SMEs engaging in
innovation and growth.

All the papers accepted will be published online
continuesly.

All contributing authors with papers accepted or under
review for this special issue will be invited to the CINet
Conference for participation at dedicated workshops,
tracks and/or symposia during 2019/2020.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Welcome to Administrative Sciences, the journal aims to
advance and communicate knowledge concerning
management theory and practice both in public
administration and in profit organizations; it encourages
submissions that build on interdisciplinary research in
related fields, such as business, economics, political
science, gender studies, psychology, sociology, physiology,
communication theory or artificial intelligence and their
implications on management, organizations and the
society. Join us on a journey through the Administrative
Sciences, where management merges with innovation.
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